RESOLUTION 2021-106

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE AWARD OF A CONTRACT
WITH AN ESTIMATED COST BETWEEN $6,600.00 AND $44,000.00
WITHOUT PUBLIC ADVERTISING FOR BIDS

WHEREAS, the “Local Public Contracts Law” provides that except for contracts which require
the performance of professional services, all contracts or agreements which do not require public
advertising for bids and the estimated cost or price is between $6,600.00 and $44,000.00, two (2) or
more competitive quotations as to cost or price, whenever practicable, shall be solicited by the
contracting agent, and the contract or agreement shall be made with and awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder; and

WHEREAS, The Bordentown Sewerage Authority has solicited from the following bidders the
respective quotations as to price:

BIDDER PRICE
Coyne Chemical Company $15,954.04 ($2.68 per pound)
Univar Solutions $19,109.13 ($3.21 per pound)

for the following goods or services:
5,953 Pounds of BASF Zetag 7563 Polymer (108 — 55.12 Pound Bags)

WHEREAS, a Certificate of Availability of Funds has been provided by the designated certifying
finance officer and is attached hereto.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, this 20t day of December, 2021, that contracts, be
and the same are hereby awarded to:

Coyne Chemical
in an amount not to exceed $15,954.04 ($2.68 per pound) for the goods or services described above.
THE BORDENTOWN SEWERAGE AUTHORITY

M) s g oy . Etleesdltnitt,

M. Ellen Gulbinsky, Chairwoman(/ =

. KMalorfe, Ill, Secretary
.~ | have reviewed this Resolution and the Certificate of Availability of Funds and am satisfied that

Anthoh T. Drollas Jr., Esquire
Genera ¥\Geu( el



CERTIFICATE OF AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS

I, Elizabeth J. Kwelty, Administrative Manager and Certifying Finance Officer of
The Bordentown Sewerage Authority, do hereby certify, pursuant to the rules of the
Department of Community Affairs, Division of Local Government Services (N.J.A.C. 5:34-

5.1 et seq.), that there are available adequate funds for the following proposed contract:

CONTRACT: 5,953 Pounds of BASF Zetag 7563 Polymer (108-
55.12 Pound Bags)

CONTRACTOR: Coyne Chemical Company

CONTRACT AMOUNT: $15,954.04

BUDGETARY LINE ITEM: 01-003-660A

| certify that the same funds have not been certified as available for more than one

pending contract. M
12/20/2021 7 7
Date Elizabeth J. Kwelty
Certifying Finance Officer




THE BORDENTOWN SEWERAGE AUTHORITY
QUOTATION RECORD FORM

PROJECT: Polymer Purchase

ITEM OR SERVICE: BASF Zetag Polymer
If not awarded to lowest price, explanation:.

1. Vendor: Coyne Chemical Company
Price: $2.68 Per Pd
Special Terms:.

Solicited By: X Email [J Fax ] Phone LI In Person UlInternet
2. Vendor: Univar Solutions
Price: $3.21 Per Pd
Special Terms:.
Solicited By: Email U] Fax [J Phone UJ In Person UlInternet
3. Vendor:.
Price:.
Special Terms:.
Solicited By: L] Email [J Fax L] Phone L In Person Ulnternet
4. Vendor..
Price:.
Special Terms..
Solicited By: ] Email U Fax L1 Phone (I In Person Uinternet
AWARDED TO: Coyne Chemical Company
PRICE:15,954.04
TERMS:5,953 Pds at 2.68 Per Pd Delivered SPECIAL
COMMENTS..
PURCHASE ORDER #.
DATE12/3/2021

SOLICITATION PERFOWC.W%' %z
(SIGNATURE) ( Lol

—

95-20 /
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Charles Bluhm Jr.

From: Jimmy Tedesco <jimmy.tedesco@UnivarSolutions.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 2, 2021 11:38 AM

To: Charles Bluhm Jr.

Cc: Jimmy Tedesco

Subject: RE: Polymer Quote

Chuck,

Here you go.. Here is what we can do for you. Our Pallets are 40 bags( 55.12 per Ibs. ). The lead time is 10-14
days or so. The price is $ 3.21 per Ibs. delivered. The pc is 16153028 Zetag 7563. If you want to go with us the sooner
you send over the order and PO the better because then we can give you the true lead time. It's coming from out
warehouse down south and this way it get to you when needed.

So are you looking for 2 % pallet? That would be 108 bags each had 40 bags to the pallet.

Thanks again

Jimmy Tedesco
Sales Account Manager Il
Univar Solutions

P: 732-215-6331

DOEOO

From: Charles Bluhm Jr. <Chuck@bordentownsa.org>

Sent: Thursday, December 2, 2021 9:22 AM

To: Jimmy Tedesco <jimmy.tedesco@UnivarSolutions.com>
Subject: Polymer Quote

CAUTION: EXTERNAL EMAIL - Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning Jimmy
Can you please send me a price quote and lead time for the following:

108 — 55.12 Bags of BASF Zetag 7563 polymer

Thanks and have a great day. Chuck

Chiirtls Hbottn. J
Operations Supervisor
Bordentown Sewerage Authority
Phone : 609-291-9105

Fax : 609-291-9079

Email : Chuck@bordentownsa.org




